Bid Tabulation
ITB 23-19

SEED & FERTILIZER

Sandra Tellis, Principal Buyer -Ph:205-325-8707/E: telliss@jccal.org

2

**OR * SUBTITUTIONS

1

HUMPHRIES FARM TURF

[DESCRIPTION UNIVERSAL PRO SUPPLY
SECTION I. GRASS FEED EST. QTY Unit Price Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
1 ANNUAL RYEGRASS 1000 LBS $ 1.00 | $ 1.000.00 | $ 068 | % 680.00
2 BROWN TOP MILLET 500 LBS $ 065 % 32500 | $ 052 | $ 260.00
3 FALCON TURF TYPE FESCUE/ TITAN** 500LBS |g 215|$ 107500 s 169 | $ 845.00
4 GRAIN RYE S00LBS |g 050 | $ 250.00 | $ 049 | $ 245.00
5 HAIRY VETCH// AU MERIT** 500 LBS $ 3.00 (% 1,500.00 | $ 198 $ 990.00
6 HULLED BERMUDA GRASS 1500 LBS $ 9.00|$ 13,500.00 | $ 480 | $ 7.200.00
7 UNHULLED BERMUDA GRASS 1000 LBS $ 7251 $ 7250.00 | $ 480 | $ 4.800.00
8 KENTUCKY 31 TALL RESCUE 2500 LBS $ 200! % 5.000.00 | $ 149 | $ 3725.00
9 ORCHARD GRASS S00LBS |g 350 | $ 1,750.00 | $ 1.99 | $ 995.00
10 PENSACOLA BAHIAGRASS 1000 LBS $ 450 | $ 4,500.00 | $ 415 | $ 4,150.00
11 WEEPING LOVEGRASS 150 LBS $ 7.00 | $ 1,050.00 | $ 459 | $ 688.50
12 WHEAT SOLBS | ¢ 0.35 | $ 175.00 | $ 0.34 | $ 170.00
13 REGAL LADINO CLOVER 500 LBS $ 575 | ¢ 2.860.00 | $ 470 | $ 2.350.00
14 RESEEDING CRIMSON CLOVER 1000 LBS $ 090 | $ 900.00 | $ 1.09 | $ 1,090.00
15 WHITE DUTCH CLOVER 500 LBS $ 3.65 | $ 1,825.00 $ 229 | $ 1,145.00
16 CLOVER CULTURE/ 1-PK-40Z/ ** 75 LBS/PK* NO BID NO BID $ 17.89 | $ 1.341.75
17 CROWN VETCH CULTURE/ 1-PK-40Z.** 75 LBS/PK* NO BID NO BID $ 16.49 | $ 1.236.75
18 LESPEDEZA CULTURE/ 1-PK-40Z.**- 150 LBS/PK* NO BID NO BID $ 16.49 | $ 2 473.50
19 WHITE CLOVER CULTURE/1PK - 4 O.Z** 75 LBS/PK* NO BID NO BID $ 1849 | $ 1.386.75
20 HULLED SERICEA 1000 LBS $ 6.50 | $ 6.500.00 | $ 479 | $ 4,790.00




** OR * SUBTITUTIONS 1 HUMPHRIES FARM TURF
DESCRIPTION UNIVERSAL PRO SUPPLY

21 UNHULLED SERICEA 500 LBS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

22 KOBE 1000LBS ¢ 200|$  200000] NOBID NO BID

23 CROWN VETCH 250 LBS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Section | Total $ $ 59.70 $ 51,460.00 $ 109.75 $ 40,562.25
S<ClionRIEREERTIEIZER EST. QmY Unit Price /50#BAG?] Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price

1 13-13-13 50 LBS $ 1275 $ 1275 | $ 026 (9% 13.00

2 8/8/2008 8000LBS | $ 10.00 | $ 1,600.00 | $ 022 (9% 1,760.00
Section 11 Total $ $ 2275 $ 161275 $ 048 $ 1,773.00
Section II: TIME RELEASE EST.QTY Unit Price/50#BAG* Ext. Price Unit Price Ext. Price
OPTION 1 12% Release 12,000 Ibs NO BID NO BID $ 031|$ 3,720.00
OPTION 2 25% Release / 23-3-10*/ 12-13-6* 12,0001bs | $ 1325 | $ 3,180.00 | $ 034 |$ 4,080.00
OPTION 3 50 % Release/29-0-7* 12,0001bs | $ 1550 | $ 3,720.00 | $ 044 | $ 5,280.00
Section 111 Total $ $ 2875 $ 6,900.00 $ 1.09 $ 13,080.00
Grand Total Sections I-111 $ 3 11120 $ 59,972.75 $ 11132 $ 55,415.25
Delivery is guraranteed not later than _ days after order date. 5 10
Notification of Intent to Respond YES YES
Non-Collusion Affidavit YES YES
EEOC Form DID NOT COMPLETE YES
Debarment Statement DID NOT COMPLETE YES
Affidavit of Contractor (E-Verify) DID NOT COMPLETE NO
Signature Page YES YES
PACA Form YES YES

CONTACT INFORMATION

1. UNIVERSAL PRO/ 5521 EASTCLIFF INDUSTRIAL BLVD. BIRMINGHAM AL 35210/ MARK RHODES PH: 205-838-1415 EMAIL: MARK@AGRI-AFC.COM

2. HUMPHRIES FARM TURF SUPPLY/P.0. BOX 39 CULLMAN AL 35087/ MISTY MARTIN PH: 256-586-4342 EMAIL: HUMPHRIESTURF@TELCO.NET




